MATERIAL SUPPORTING THE AGENDA

Volume XXIXa

This volume contains the Material Supporting the Agenda furnished to
each member of the Board of Regents prior to the meetings held on

October 8-9, 1981
December 10-11, 1981

The material is divided according to the standing committees and the
meetings that were held and is color coded as follows:

White paper - for the documentation of all items that
were presented before the deadline date.

Blue paper - all items submitted to the Executive Session
and distributed only to the Regents, Chancellor and
Executive Vice Chancellors of the System.

Yellow paper - Emergency items distributed at the meeting.

Material distributed at the meeting as additional documentation is not
included in the bound volume, because sometimes there is an unusual
amount and other times some people get copies and some do not get
copies. If the Executive Secretary was furnished a copy, then that
material goes into the appropriate subject file.
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BOARD OF REGENTS
of
THE UNIVERSITY OF TEXAS SYSTEM

CALENDAR
Place: Fourth Floor, Classroom Building, U. T. Permian Basin

University Boulevard at Parkway Boulevard
Odessa, Texas

Host Institution: = The University of Texas of the Permian Basin

Thursday, December 10, 1981

10:00 a.m. Meeting of the Board of Regents
Committee Meetings

10:30 a. m. Health Affairs Committee
Classroom Building, Room 437

Finance and Audit Committee
Classroom Building, Room 461

1:30 p. m. Academic Affairs Committee
Classroom Building, Room 437

Buildings and Grounds Committee
Classroom Building, Room 461

3:30 p. m. Land and Investment Committee
Classroom Building, Room 437

If time Executive Session
permits Classroom Building, Room 405

Friday, December 11, 1981

9:00 a.m. Meeting of the Board of Regents

Executive Session (if not completed on
Thursday afternoon)

Reports of Standing Committees

Executive Committee

Finance and Audit Committee
Academic Affairs Committee
Health Affairs Committee
Buildings and Grounds Committee
Land and Investment Committee

Meeting of the Board of Regents

Telephone Numbers

President Cardozier (Residence 362-5679) (915) 367-2100
(915) 367-2102

Holiday Inn (915) 333-3931
(3001 Highway 80)

Continental Airlines 563-2100

Southwest Airlines 563-0750
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AGENDA FOR MEETING
of
BOARD OF REGENTS
of
THE UNIVERSITY OF TEXAS SYSTEM

Date: December 10, 1981

Time: .10:00 a. m

Place: Conference Area, Fourth Floor, West End
Classroom Building, U. T. Permian Basin

A. CALL TO ORDER
RECESS FOR MEETINGS OF THE STANDING COMMITTEES

The Standing Committees of the Board of Regents of The University
of Texas System will meet as set forth below to consider recom-
mendations on those matters on the agenda for each Committee as
listed in the Material Supporting the Agenda.

10:30 a.m. Health Affairs Committee: Chairman Newton,
Vice-Chairman Fly, Regent Briscoe..
Classroom Building, Room 437

Finance and Audit Committee: Chairman Rhodes,
Vice-Chairman Blumberg, Regent Richards
Classroom Building, Room 461

1:30 p. m. Academic Affairs Committee: Chairman Blumberg,
Vice-Chairman Briscoe, Regent Hay
Classroom Building, Room 437

Buildings and Grounds Committee: Chairman Richards,
Vice-Chairman Milburn, Regent Powell
Classroom Building, Room 461

3:30 p. m. ‘Land and Investment Committee: Chairman Hay,
Vice-Chairman Newton, Regent Milburn
Classroom Building, Room 437

The report and recommendations of each Standing Committee will be
considered by the Board of Regents beginning at 9:00 a. m. on Decem-
ber 11, 1981.

If time permits following the meetmgs of the Standing Committees,
the Board of Regents will convene in Executive Session in Room 405
pursuant to Vernon's Texas Civil Statutes, Article 6252-17, Sections
2(e), (f) and (g), to consider those matters set out in the Mater1a1
Supporting the Agenda, Page Ex.S 1 .
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AGENDA FOR MEETING
of ~
BOARD OF REGENT
of
THE UNIVERSITY OF TEXAS SYSTEM

Date: December 11, 1981

Time: 9:00 a. m.

Place: Conference Area, Fourth Floor, West End
Classroom Building, U. T. Permian Basin

A.-B. (PageBofR-1)

C. RECONVENE

D. WELCOME AND PRESENTATION BY PRESIDENT CARDOZIER

E. REPORT ON SOIL CONSERVATION AND LAND UTILIZATION BY
MR. BILLY CARR, MANAGER OF UNIVERSITY LANDS - SURFACE
INTERESTS

F. APPROVAL OF MINUTES OF REGENTS' MEETING HELD
| OCTOBER 8-9, 1981

G. INTRODUCTIONS
1. U. T. Arlington - President Nedderman
2. U. T. Austin - President Flawn

Dallas - Acting President Clark

L]

El Paso - President Monroe

H H 8 88 A 43 3 9

Permian Basin - President Cardozier

San Antonio - President Wagener

Tyler - President Hamm

Institute of Texan Cultures - Executive Director Maguire

Health Science Center - Dallas - President Sprague

-3
¢ @ @ a o a g

10. Galveston Medical Branch - President Levin

11. U. Health Science Center - Houston - President Bulger
12. U. T. Health Science Center - San Antonio -~ President Harrison
13. U. T. Cancer Center - President LeMaistre

14. U. T. Health Center - Tyler - Director Hurst

15. Others

BofR -2




H. IF BUSINESS NOT CONCLUDED ON THURSDAY, RECESS FOR
MEETING OF THE BOARD OF REGENTS IN EXECUTIVE SESSION
IN ROOM 405 OF THE CLASSROOM BUILDING PURSUANT TO
V.T.C.S., ARTICLE 6252-17, SECTIONS 2(e), (f) AND (g)
MSA PAGE Ex.S - 1

I. RECONVENE TO CONSIDER REPORTS AND RECOMMENDATIONS
FROM THE STANDING COMMITTEES

1. Executive Committee
Committee Vice-Chairman Fly
MSA Page Ex.C -1

2. Finance and Audit Committee
Committee Chairman Rhodes
MSA Page F&A -1

3. Academic Affairs Committee
Committee Chairman (Mrs.) Blumberg
MSA Page AAC - 1

4. Health Affairs Committee
Committee Chairman Newton
MSA Page HAC -1

5. Buildings and Grounds Committee
Committee Chairman Richards
MSA Page B&G -1

6. Land and Investment Committee
Committee Chairman Hay
MSA Page L&I -1

The agenda for the meeting of the Board of Regents is continued on
Page B of R - 4 following the last tab in the Material Supporting the Agenda.

Bof R-3
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EXECUTIVE COMMITTEE
Committee Vice-Chairman Fly

Date: December 11, 1981

Time: Following the Executive Session of the Board of Regents

Place: Conference Area, Fourth Floor - West End
Classroom Building, U. T. Permian Basin

1. U. T. Austin - College of Business Administration and
Graduate School of Business - Phase I, University
Teaching Center (Project No. 102-480): Recommended
Award of Construction Contract to B. L. McGee, Inc.,
Austin, Texas, Additional Appropriation Therefor and
Recommended Plaque Inscription (3- B&G-82)

2. U. T. Austin - Memorial Stadium/Bellmont Hall - 9th
Level Improvements (Project No. 102-490): Recom-
mended Award of Construction Contract to B&B
Developers, Moody, Texas, and Additional Appro-
priation Therefor (3- B&G-82)

3. U. T. Austin - Marine Science Institute at Port
Aransas - Auditorium (Project No. 102-493): Recom-
mended Award of Construction Contract to McDaniel
Construction Co., Inc., San Antonio, Texas, Addi-
tional Appropriation Therefor and Recommended
Plaque Inscription (2-B&G-82)

4, U. T. El Paso - College of Business Administration
Classroom and Office Building (Project No. 201-421):
Recommended Award of Contracts for Furniture and
Furnishings to (a) Business Products and Services,
Inc., El Paso, Texas; (b) Rockford Business Interiors,
Austin, Texas; (¢) Stewart Office Supply Co., Dallas,
Texas; (d) Regal Supply & Chemical, El Paso, Texas;
(e) American Desk Mfg. Company, Temple, Texas;

(f) E. G. Jenkins Co., Dallas, Texas; and (g) House of
Carpets, Inc., El Paso, Texas (2-B&G-82)

5. U. T. San Antonio - Multidisciplinary Studies Building
and Addition to Arts Building (Phase II Buildings) (Proj-
ect No. 401-334): Recommended Award of Contracts
for Furniture and Furnishings to Paul Anderson Co.,
San Antonio, Texas (3-B&G-82)

6. U. T. Health Science Center - Dallas - Renovation
of Locke Building, Phase I (Project No. 303-476):
Recommended Award of Construction Contract to
Dallas Contractors, Inc., Dallas, Texas (3-B&G-82)

Ex.C-1

or Following the 9:00 a. m. Session of the Board of Regents

Page
Ex.C
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7.

U. T. Austin, U. T. Health Science Center - Dallas

(U. T. Southwestern Medical School - Dallas), U. T.

Galveston Medical Branch (U. T. Galveston Medical
School), U. T. Health Science Center - San Antonio
(U. T. Medical School - San Antonio), and U. T.
Cancer Center: Amendments to 1981-82 Budget

(1-B-82 and 2-B-82)

Ex.C -2

Page
Ex.C

35




1. U. T. Austin - College of Business Administration and Graduate School
of Business - Phase I, University Teaching Center (Project No. 102-480):
Recommended Award of Construction Contract to B. L. McGee, Inc.,
Austin, Texas, Additional Appropriation Therefor and Recommended
Plaque Inscription (3-B&G-82). --

RECOMMENDATION

The Executive Committee concurs in the recommendation of President
Flawn and the Office of the Chancellor that the Board:

a. Award the construction contract for the University
Teaching Center building to the lowest responsible
bidder, B. L. McGee, Inc., Austin, Texas, as follows:

Base Bid $13,777,000
Alternate No. 1

(Improved Quality of
Corridor Walls and

Floors) 135,000
Total Recommended Contract Award $13,912,000
b. Authorize a total project cost of $17,978,228 to cover

the recommended building construction contract award,
movable furnishings and equipment, audio/video/visual
equipment, air balancing, landscaping, fees and
related project expenses

c. Appropriate additional funds in the amount of
$17,167,228 from Available University Fund to provide
for the total project cost. Previous appropriations
have been $136,000 from Permanent University Fund Bond
Proceeds, and $675,000 from the Available University
Fund -

d. Approve the recommended inscription as set out below
for the plaque to be placed on the University Teaching
Center building.
This inscription follows the standard pattern approved
by the Board at the meeting held June 1, 1979.

UNIVERSITY TEACHING CENTER

1981
BOARD OF REGENTS

James L. Powell, Chairman E. D. Walker
Sterling H. Fly, Jr., Vice~Chairman Chancellor, The University
Tom B. Rhodes, Vice-Chairman of Texas System
Jane Weinert Blumberg Peter T. Flawn,

(Mrs. Roland K.) President, The University
Janey Briscoe of Texas at Austin

(Mrs. Dolph)
Jess Hay Graeber, Simmons & Cowan,
Beryl Buckley Milburn AIA Architects, In
Jon P. Newton Association with
Howard N. Richards R. Max Brooks, F.A.I.A.

Project Architect
B. L. McGee, Inc.
Contractor '

Ex.C -3




BACKGROUND INFORMATION

In accordance with authorization of the U. T. Board of Regents on
October 9, 1981, bids were called for and were received, opened
and tabulated on November 3, 1981, as shown on Page Ex.C -5 for the
University Teaching Center building. The estimated total project
cost previously authorized was $18,920,000 exclusive of
electronic media equipment. It is now estimated that the
audio/video/visual equipment to support twenty-six major instruc-
tional and lecture-theatre type classrooms to accommodate 3,500
students will cost approximately $1,613,000. However, the
extremely favorable construction bids will allow for a reduced
total project cost of $17,978,228 which includes an allowance for
audio/video/visual equipment purchase.

The recommended total project cost is composed of the following
cost elements:

Construction Contract $13,912,000
Furniture, Furnishings and

Equipment 599,963
Audio/Video/Visual Equipment 1,613,000

Future Work (Air Balancing,
Facilities Control Monitoring
System Interface, Communication

Duct) 250,000
Project Contingency (Unforeseen

Conditions at Restricted Site) 300,000
Professional Fees and

Administrative Expense 1,273,693
Miscellaneous Expenses

(Site Survey, Soils Test) 29,572
Total Project Cost $17,978,228

Source of funding for this project is the Available University
Fund and Permanent University Fund Bond Proceeds.

Ex.C -4




COLLEGE OF BUSINESS ADMINISTRATION AND GRADUATE SCHOOL OF BUSINESS - PHASE I

UNIVERSITY TEACHING CENTER,

Bidder
B. L. McGee, Inc., Austin, Texas

Castle Construction Co., Inc.,
Montgomery, Alabama

4 The Law Company, Inc.,

» Wichita, Kansas

Q

1 Durden & Fulton, Inc., Starstone

en Construction Co., A Joint Venture,
Pittsburg, Pennsylvania

Kunz Construction Co., Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

J. C. Evans Construction Co., Inc.,
Austin, Texas

Belco Construction Co., Inc.,
Temple, Texas

Robert E. McKee, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

Warrior Constructors, Inc.,
Houston, Texas

Base Bid

$13,777,000

14,595,000

14,775,000

14,781,000

15,460,339

15,472,000

15,598,000

15,840,000

15,925,000

Alt, No. 1

$135,000
129,000

130,000

130,000

128,856

130,000

133,000

147,000

132,000

THE UNIVERSITY OF TEXAS AT AUSTIN
Bids Received Tuesday, November 3, 1981, C.S.T. at the
Office of Facilities Planning and Construction
The University of Texas System, Austin, Texas

Total Bid

$13,912,000

14,724,000

14,905,000

14,911,000

15,589,195

15,602,000

15,731,000

15,987,000

16,057,000

Bid Bond

5%

5%

5%

5%

5%

5%

5%

5%

5%




2. U. T. Austin - Memorial Stadium/Bellmont Hall - 9th Level Improve-
ments (Project No. 102-490): Recommended Award of Construction
Contract to B&B Developers, Moody, Texas, and Additional Appro-
priation Therefor (3-B&G-82). --

RECOMMENDATION

The Executive Committee concurs in the recommendation of President
Flawn and the Office of the Chancellor that the Board:

a. Award the construction contract for Improvements on the
9th Level of Memorial Stadium/Bellmont Hall to the
lowest responsible bidder, B&B Developers, Moody,
Texas, as follows:

Base Bid $887,777
Alternate No. 2 Add Vinyl
Wall Covering 5,600
Alternate No. 3 Add Kitchen
Equipment 30,000
Total Recommended Contract Award $923,377
b. Authorize a total project cost of $§1,110,948 to cover

the recommended construction contract award, movable
furnishings and equipment, air balancing, fees and
related project expenses

c. Appropriate additional funds in the amount of
$1,110,948 from Gift Funds designated for this project
to provide for the total project cost.

Previously $10,000 was appropriated from Intercollegiate
Athletics Funds for the feasibility study, and $35,000 from the
same source for fees and related expenses through completion of
final plans. The appropriation of the total project cost will
now return $35,000 to Intercollegiate Athletics Funds.

BACKGROUND INFORMATION

In accordance with authorization of the U. T. Board of Regents on
October 9, 1981, bids were called for and were received, opened
and tabulated on November 4, 1981, as shown on Page Ex.C - 8 for the
Improvements to the 9th Level of Memorial Stadium/Bellmont

Hall. The estimated total project cost previously authorized was
$960,000. The nine bids received demonstrate competition and the
low bid is considered to be the fair market value of the work.

U. T. Austin Administration has reviewed the bids with the Texas
Longhorn Educational Foundation, and the Foundation has agreed to
support the recommended contract award and a revised total
project cost of $1,110,948.

The Coordinating Board, Texas College and University System
approved this project at its October 1981, meeting and this
recommendation remains within the limits of that approval.

Ex.C -6




The recommended total project cost is composed of the following
cost elements:

Construction Contract Base Bid and

Alternates 2 and 3 $ 923,377

Furniture and Furnishings, Equipment,
and Carpet 120,000
Project Contingency 20,000
Professional Fees 46,471
Miscellaneous Expenses 1,100
Total Project Cost $1,110,948

Source of funding for this project is the Texas Longhorn
Education Foundation and other private sources.

Ex.C - T




8 - O'xXH

Bidder

B&B Developers,
Moody, Texas

Turner Pilkinton Const.
Co., Inc., Austin, Texas

Starfield Constructors,

Inc. & Jerome Stark,
Elgin, Texas

Lawless & Alford, Inc.,
Austin, Texas

Charles N. White Constr.
Company, Austin, Texas

Faulkner Construction Co.,

Austin, Texas

Thomas Hinderer Company,
Austin, Texas

Joe Badgett Construction
Co., Inc., Austin, Texas

Poth Corp. & R. T.
Templeton, Austin, Texas

MEMORIAL STADIUM/BELLMONT HALL 9TH LEVEL IMPROVEMENTS
THE UNIVERSITY OF TEXAS AT AUSTIN
Bids Received at 2:00 p.m., C.S.T., November 4, 1981 at the
Office of Facilities Planning and Construction
The University of Texas System, Austin, Texas

Add Alt. #1 Add Alt. #2 Add Alt. #3 Add Alt. #4 Bid
Base Bid Temp. Glass Vinyl Cover. Kit. Equip. Meeting Rm. Bond
$887,777 $ 23,000 $ 5,600 $ 30,000 $ 14,000 5%
896,900 20,500 13,550 25,000 10,000 5%
899,900 16,000 5,500 25,000 7,600 5%
924,000 16,000 7,000 21,000 6,200 5%
930,900 26,200 6,520 22,520 7,400 5%
978,500 15,600 4,400 21,500 7,000 5%
1,005,000 15,000 6,500 24,000 8,000 5%
1,009,054 26,040 9,000 23,520 8,038 5%

1,044,011 14,649 4,558 25,360 7,169 5%




3. U. T. Austin - Marine Science Institute at Port Aransas - Auditorium
{Project No. 102-493): Recommended Award of Construction Contract
to McDaniel Construction Co., Inc., San Antonio, Texas, Additional
Appropriation Therefor and Recommended Plaque Inscription

(2-B&G-82). --

RECOMMENDATION

The Executive Committee concurs in the recommendation of President
Flawn and the Office of the Chancellor that the Board:

a. Award a construction contract for U. T. Austin - Marine
Science Institute at Port Aransas - Auditorium Building
to the lowest responsible bidder, McDaniel Construction
Co., Inc., San Antonio, Texas as follows:

Base Bid $ 970,176

Alternate No. 1
Ramp, Stairway & Canopy 55,392

Alternate No. 2
Concrete Covering on
Interior Columns 3,730

Total Contract Award $1,029,298

b. Authorize a total project cost of $1,400,000 to cover
the recommended construction contract award, movable
furnishings and equipment, fees and related project
expenses

c. Appropriate additional funds in the amount of $1,340,000
from Permanent University Fund Bond Proceeds to provide
for the total project cost. Previous appropriations
include $50,000 from Permanent University Fund Bond
Proceeds and $10,000 from Interest on Construction Funds
Time Deposits

d. Approve the inscription as set out below for the plaque
to be placed on the building which follows the standard
pattern approved by the U. T. Board at the meeting held
June 1, 1979.

Auditorium Building

1981
BOARD OF REGENTS

James L. Powell, Chairman E. D. Walker
Sterling H. Fly, Jr., Vice~Chairman Chancellor, The University
Tom B. Rhodes, Vice-Chairman of Texas System
Jane Weinert Blumberg Peter T. Flawn

(Mrs. Roland K.) President, The University
Janey Briscoe of Texas at Austin

(Mrs. Dolph)
Jess Hay Rapp Fash Sundin, Inc.
Beryl Buckley Milburn ‘ Project Architect
Jon P. Newton McDaniel Construction
Howard N. Richards Co., Inc., Contractor

Ex.C -9




BACKGROUND INFORMATION

At the meeting of October 8 - 9, 1981, the U. T. Board of Regents
approved final plans and specifications for the U. T. Austin
Marine Science Institute at Port Aransas -~ Auditorium Building at
an estimated total project cost of $1,550,000. The Coordinating
Board, Texas College and University System approved the project
at its October 1981 meeting.

Accordingly, bids were called for, received, opened and tabulated
on October 27, 1981, as shown on Page Ex.C - 11

A contract award to McDaniel Construction Co., Inc. of the base
bid and Alternate Bids 1 and 2 in the amount of $1,029,298 will
allow the total project cost to be reduced to $1,400,000.

The recommended total project cost is composed of the following
cost elements:

Construction Contract (Base

Bid and aAlts. 1 and 2) $1,029,298
Furniture, Furnishings and

Aquaria Equipment 230,000
Future Work (Air Balancing

Allowance) 3,000
Project Contingency (Unknown

Soil Conditions) 73,442
Professional Fees : 63,760
Miscellaneous Expenses 500
Total Project Cost ) $1,400,000

Ex.C - 10
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MARINE SCIENCE INSTITUTE AT PORT ARANSAS - AUDITORIUM
THE UNIVERSITY OF TEXAS AT AUSTIN

BIDS RECEIVED TUESDAY, OCTOBER 27, 1981 AT 2:00 p.m., C.S.T. at the
Marine Science Institute, Port Aransas, Texas

Bidder

Mchaniel Construction Co., Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

Durden & Fulton, Incorporated;
Joe R. Fulton; T. Ralph Durden,
A Joint Venture, Corpus Christi,
Texas

CJB Construction, Inc.,
Corpus Christi, Texas

Casey & Glass, Inc.,
Corpus Christi, Texas

Ewing Construction Co., Inc.,
Corpus Christi, Texas

Toland Construction Co., Inc.
Taft, Texas

Base Bid

$970,176

1,087,000

1,097,000

1,099,000

1,130,000

1,124,000

Alt. #1
Ramp & Stairway

Alt. #2
Conc. Columns

$55,392

78,000

91,200
90,000
101,000

66,000

$3,730

No Add

-2,000

No change

No change

Bid Bond

5%

5%

5%

5%

5%

5%



4., U. T. El Paso - College of Business Administration Classroom and
Office Building (Project No. 201-421): Recommended Award of Con-
tracts for Furniture and Furnishings to (a) Business Products and
Services, Inc., El Paso, Texas, (b) Rockford Business Interiors,
Austin, Texas; (c) Stewart Office supply Co., Dallas, Texas;

(d) Regal Supply & Chemical, El Paso, Texas; (e) American Desk
Mig. Company, Temple, Texas; (f) E. G. Jenkins Co., Dallas, Texas;
and (g) House of Carpets, Inc., El Paso, Texas (2-B&G-82).--

RECOMMENDATION

The Executive Committee concurs in the recommendation of President
Monroe and the Office of the Chancellor that the Board:

a. Award contracts for furniture and furnishings to the
following lowest responsible bidders:

Business Products and Services, Inc.
El Paso, Texas

Base Proposal "A"
(Office Landscape Furn.) $108,350.00

Add Alternate "A-1"
(Office Landscape Furn.) 13,450.00

Total Contract Award to
Business Products and
Services, Inc. $121,800.00

Rockford Business
Interiors, Austin, Texas

Base Proposal "B"
(Wood Office Furn.) 227,525.27

Add Alternate "B-l"—
(Addl. Wood Office
Furn.) 32,047.40

Alternate Proposal npo1n
(Auditorium Seating) 57,827.80

Base Proposal "G"
(Adj. Typing Classroom
Tables) 9,004.34

Base Proposal "H"
(Guest Chairs) 10,917.50

Add Alternate "H-1"
(Addl. Guest Chairs) 1,909.50

Total Contract Award to
Rockford Business
Interiors ' 339,231.81

Stewart Office Supply Co.,
Dallas, Texas

Base Proposal "C"
(Steel Stacking Chairs) 3,014.00
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Regal Supply & Chemical,
El Paso, Texas

Base Proposal "D"
(Maintenance Equipment) 13,995.60

American Desk Mfg.
Company, Temple, Texas

Base Proposal "E"
(Lecture Hall Seating) 82,480.85

E. G. Jenkins Co.,
Dallas, Texas

Base Proposal "I"
(Window Blinds &
Draperies) 7,396.09

Add Alt. "I-1"
(Lined Blackout
Draperies) 600.73

Total Contract Award to
E. G. Jenkins Co. 7,996.82

House of Carpets, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

Base Proposal "J"
(Carpet) 36,664.00

GRAND TOTAL RECOMMENDED CONTRACT AWARDS $605,183.08

b. Appropriate $605,183.08 from Permanent University Fund
Bond Proceeds to the Furnishings and Equipment Account
for the award of the contracts.

BACKGROUND INFORMATION

In accordance with authorization of the U. T. Board of Regents on
June 1, 1979, bids were called for and were received, opened and
tabulated on October 27, 1981, as shown on Pages Ex.C 14 - 31

for College of Business Administration Classroom and Office Building.

In regard to Base Proposal "D" (Maintenance Equipment), only one
bid was received. A telephone canvass revealed that among the
five possible bidders, only three local dealers were interested
because of potential warranty service. However, two of those
local dealers stated that they were too busy to respond to the
bid. The bid received was less than the estimated cost of
$14,400.00. It is therefore believed that rebidding would not
produce improved results,

In regard to Base Proposal "F", Alternate Proposal "F-1" was
selected in lieu of Base Proposal "F", which provides for moulded
plastic shell auditorium seat and backrests. Alternate "F-1"
provides for a superior quality and more durable auditorium
seating with upholstered seats and backrests. The auditorium
will be widely used, serving both the University and the general
community. The more comfortable seating is desired.
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FURNITURE AND FURNISHINGS FOR COLLEGE OF BUSINESS ADMINISTRATION AND OFFICE BUILDING
PROJECT NO. 201-421, THE UNIVERSITY OF TEXAS AT EL PASO, EL PASO, TEXAS

Bids were Received at 2:00 p.m., Central Standard Time, Tuesday, October 27, 1981 at the
Office of Facilities Planning and Construction, The University of Texas System, Austin, Texas

Bidder

Bid
Bond

Business Products & Services, C.C.

Inc., El Paso, Texas

Clegg/Austin Marshall
Clegg & Assoc., Inc.,
Austin, Texas

Stewart Office Supply Co.,

Dallas, Texas

Abel Contract Fumiture &
Equipment Co., Inc.,
Austin, Texas

American Desk Mfg. Co.,
Temple, Texas

The Carpet Pile of Texas,
Inc., El1 Paso, Texas

The Carpet Shop,
El Paso, Texas

Carpet Services of
San Antonio,
San Antonio, Texas

$7,000.00

5%

5%

C.C.'s
$66.25 and
$1,800.00

c.c.
$2,019.40

5%

Base Proposal "A"
(Ofc. Land. Fumiture)

$108,350.00

$129,452.64

$131,143.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Bidder

Business Products & Services,

Inc., El1 Paso, Texas

Clegg/Austin Marshall
Clegg & Assoc., Inc.,
Austin, Texas

Stewart Office Supply Co.,

Dallas, Texas

Abel Contract Furniture &
Equipment Co., Inc.,
Austin, Texas

American Desk Mfg. Co.,
Temple, Texas

The Carpet Pile of Texas,
El Paso, Texas

The Carpet Shop,
El Paso, Texas

Carpet Services of
San Antonio,
San Antonio, Texas

No

No

No

No

No

Add Alternate "“A-1"
(0ffice Landscape Furniture)

$13,450.00

$15,584.73

$16,632.00

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid
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Bidder

Central Distributing Co.,
San Antonio, Texas

Commercial Carpets
Consultants of Texas,
E1l Paso, Texas

E. G. Jenkins Co.,
Dallas, Texas

Highland Interiors Inc.,
Lubbock, Texas

House of Carpets, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

Regal Supply & Chemical,
E1l Paso, Texas

Rockford Business Interiors,
Austin, Texas

San Antonio Floor Finishers,
Inc., San Antonio, Texas

Sherrill Draperies, Inc.,
Irving, Texas

Wittig's, Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

Bid
Bond
5%

5%

c.C.

$399.84

5%

5%

5%

5%

5%

5%

c.C.

$151.95

Base Proposal "A"
(0fc. Land. Furniture)

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bidder

Central Distributing Co.,
San Antonio, Texas

Commercial Carpets
Consultants of Texas,
El Paso, Texas

E. G. Jenkins Co.,
Dallas, Texas

Highland Interiors Inc.,
Lubbock, Texas

House of Carpets, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

Regal Supply & Chemicali
El Paso, Texas

Rockford Business Interiors,
Austin, Texas

San Antonio Floor Finishers,
Inc., San Antonlo, Texas

Sherrill Draperies, Inc.,
Irving, Texas

Wittig's, Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

Add Alternate "A-1"
(0Office Landscape Furniture)

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid
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Bidder

Rockford Business Interiors,
Austin, Texas

Abel Contract Furniture &
Equipment Co., Inc.,
Austin, Texas

American Desk Mfg. Co.,
Temple, Texas

Business Products & Services, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

The Carpet Pile of Texas, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

Carpet Services of San Antonio,
San Antonio, Texas

Central Distributing Co.,
San Antonio, Texas

Clegg/Austin Marshall Clegg
& Assoc., Inc.,
Austin, Texas

'Commercial Carpets

Consultants of Texas,
El Paso, Texas

E. G. Jenkins Co.,
Dallas, Texas

Base Proposal "B"
(Wood Ofc. Furniture)

$227,525.27

$253,902.80

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bidder

Rockford Business Interiors,
Austin, Texas

Abel Contract Furniture &
Equipment Co., Inc.,
Austin, Texas

American Desk Mfg. Co.,
Temple, Texas

Business Products & Services, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

The Carpet Pile of Texas, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

Carpet Services of San Antonio,
San Antonio, Texas

Central Distributing Co.,
San Antonio, Texas

Clegg/Austin Marshall Clegg
& Assoc., Inc.,
Austin, Texas

Commercial Carpets
Consultants of Texas,
El Paso, Texas

E. G. Jenkins Co.,
Dallas, Texas

Add Alternate "B-1"
(Wood Ofc. Furniture)

$32,047.40

$35,977.83

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid
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Bidder

Highland Interiors, Inc.,
Lubbock, Texas

House of Carpets, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

Regal Supply & Chemical
El Paso, Texas

San Antonio Floor Finishers, Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

Sherrill Draperies, Inc.,
Irving, Texas

Stewart Office Supply Co.,
Dallas, Texas

Wittig's, Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

The Carpet Shop,
El Paso, Texas

Base Proposal "B"
(Wood Ofc. Furmiture)

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bidder

Highland Interiors, Inc.,
Lubbock, Texas

House of Carpets, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

Regal Supply & Chemical
El Paso, Texas

San Antonio Floor Finishers, Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

Sherrill Draperies, Inc.,
Irving, Texas

Stewart Office Supply Co.,
Dallas, Texas

Wittig's, Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

The Carpet Shop,
El Paso, Texas

Add Alternate "B-1"
(Wood Ofc. Furmniture)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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Bidders

Base Proposal '
(Steel Stacking Chairs)

Stewart Office Supply Co., $3,014.00
Dallas, Texas

Wittig's, Inc., $3,039.04
San Antonio, Texas

Abel Contract Furniture & No Bid
Equipment Co., Inc.,
Austin, Texas

American Desk Mfg. Co., No Bid
Temple, Texas

Business Products & Services, Inc., No Bid
El Paso, Texas

The Carpet Pile of Texas, Inc., No Bid
El Paso, Texas

The Carpet Shop, No Bid
El Paso, Texas

Carpet Services of San Antonio, No Bid
San Antonio, Texas

Central Distributing Co., No Bid
San Antonio, Texas

Clegg/Austin Marshall Clegg & Assoc., Inc., No Bid
Austin, Texas

Commercial Carpets Consultants of Texas, No Bid

El Paso, Texas

Regal Supply & Chemical,
El Paso, Texas

Abel Contract Furniture &
Equipment Co., Inc.,
Austin, Texas

American Desk Mfg. Co.,
Temple, Texas

Business Products & Services, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

The Carpet Pile of Texas, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

The Carpet Shop,
El Paso, Texas

Carpet Services of San Antonio
San Antonio, Texas

Central Distributing Co.,
San Antonio, Texas

Clegg/Austin Marshall Clegg & Assoc., Inc.,
Austin, Texas

Commercial Carpets Consultants of Texas,
El Paso, Texas

E. G. Jenkins Co.,
Dallas, Texas

Base Proposa
Bidders (Maintenance Equipment)

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

$13,995.60

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid
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Bidders

E. G. Jenkins Co.,
Dallas, Texas

Highland Interiors, Inc.,
Lubbock, Texas

House of Carpets, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

Rockford Business Interiors,
Austin, Texas

Regal Supply & Chemical,
E1 Paso, Texas

San Antonio Floor Finishers, Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

Sherrill Draperies, Inc.,
Irving, Texas

Base Proposal "C"
(Steel Stacking Chairs)

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bidders

Highland Interiors, Inc.,
Lubbock, Texas

House of Carpets, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

Rockford Business Interiors
Austin, Texas

San Antonio Floor Finishers, Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

Sherrill Draperies, Inc.,
Irving, Texas

Stewart Office Supply Co.,
Dallas, Texas

Wittig's, Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

Base Proposal '"'D"
(Maintenance Equipment)

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid
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Base Proposal "E"
Bidders (Lecture Hall Seating)

American Desk Mfg. Co.,
Temple, Texas

Central Distributing Co.,
San Antonio, Texas

Abel Contract Furniture & Equipment Co., Inc.,
Austin, Texas

Business Products & Services, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

The Carpet Pile of Texas, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

The Carpet Shop,
El Paso, Texas

Carpet Services of San Antonio,
San Antonio, Texas

Clegg/Austin Marshall Clegg & Assoc., Inc.,
Austin, Texas

E. G. Jenkins Co.,
Dallas, Texas

Highland Interiors, Inc.,
Lubbock, Texas

House of Carpets, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

Regal Supply & Chemical,
El Paso, Texas

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

$82,480.85

$101,315.00

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Base Proposal "F"

Bidders (Auditorium Seating)

Central Distributing Co., $18,897.00
San Antonio, Texas

Rockford Business Interiors, $30,298.50
Austin, Texas

Abel Contract Furniture & Equipment No Bid
Co., Inc., Austin, Texas

American Desk Mfg. Co., No Bid
Temple, Texas

Business Products & Services, Inc., No Bid
El Paso, Texas

The Carpet Pile of Texas, Inc., No Bid
El Paso, Texas

The Carpet Shop, No Bid
El1 Paso, Texas

Carpet Services of San Antonio, No Bid

San Antonio, Texas

Clegg/Austin Marshall Clegg & Assoc., Inc.,
Austin, Texas

E. G. Jenkins Co.,
Dallas, Texas

Highland Interiors, Inc.,
Lubbock, Texas

House of Carpets, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

No

No

No

No

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid
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Bidders
Rockford Business Interiors
Austin, Texas

San Antonio Floor Finishers, Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

Sherrill Draperies, Inc.,
Irving, Texas

Stewart Office Company
Dallas, Texas

Wittig's, Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

Commercial Carpets Consultants of Texas,
El Paso, Texas

Base Proposal "E"
(Lecture Hall Seating)

No

No

No

No

No

No

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Base Proposal "F"
Bidders (Auditorium Seating)

Regal Supply & Chemical,
El Paso, Texas

San Antonio Floor Finishers, Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

Sherrill Draperies, Inc.,
Irving, Texas

Stewart Office Company,
Dallas, Texas

Wittig's, Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

Commercial Carpets Consultants of Texas,
El Paso, Texas

No

No

No

No

No

No

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid
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Bidders

Rockford Business Interiors,
Austin, Texas

Abel Contract Furniture &
Equipment Co., Inc.,
Austin, Texas

American Desk Mfg. Co.,
Temple, Texas

Business Products & Services, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

The Carpet Pile of Texas, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas ‘

The Carpet Shop,
El Paso, Texas

Carpet Services of San Antonio,
San Antonio, Texas

Central Distributing Co.,
San Antonio, Texas

Clegg/Austin Marshall Clegg & Assoc., Inc.,
Austin, Texas

Commercial Carpets Consultants of Texas,
El Paso, Texas

E. G. Jenkins Co.,
Dallas, Texas

Alternate "F-1"
(Auditorium Seating)

$57,827.80

$64,195.00

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Base Proposal "G"
Bidders (Adj. Typing Tables)

Rockford Business Interiors,
Austin, Texas

American Desk Mfg. Co.,
Temple, Texas

Abel Contract Furniture &
Equipment Co., Inc.,
Austin, Texas

Central Distributing Co.,
8an Antonio, Texas

The Carpet Pile of Texas, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

The Carpet Shop,
El Paso, Texas

Carpet Services of San Antonio,
San Antonio, Texas

Business Produtts & Services, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

$9,004.34

$10,344.14

$10,595.86

$14,555.52

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Clegg/Austin Marshall Clegg & Assoc., Inc., No Bid

Austin, Texas

Commercial Carpets Consultants of Texas,
El Paso, Texas

E. G. Jenkins Co.,
Dallas, Texas

No Bid

No Bid
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Bidders
Highland Interiors, Inc.,
Lubbock, Texas

House of Carpets, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

Regal Supply & Chemical
El Paso, Texas

San Antonio Floor Finishers, Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

Sherrill Draperies, Inc.,
Irving, Texas

Stewart Office Co.,
Dallas, Texas

Wittig's, Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

Alternate "F-1"
(Auditorium Seating)

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Base Proposal "G"

Bidders (Adj. Typing Tables)

Highland Interiors, Inc.,
Lubbock, Texas

House of Carpets, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

Regal Supply & Chemical,
El Paso, Texas

San Antonio Floor Finishers, Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

Sherrill Draperies, Inc.,
Irving, Texas

Stewart Office Co.,
Dallas, Texas

Wittig's, Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid
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Bidders

Rockford Business Interiors,
Austin, Texas

Abel Contract Furniture &
EqQuipment Co., Inc.,
Austin, Texas

American Desk Mfg. Co.,
Temple, Texas

Business Products & Services, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

The Carpet Pile of Texas, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

The Carpet Shop,
El Paso, Texas

Carpet Services of San Antonio,
San Antonio, Texas

Central Distributing Co.,
San Antonio, Texas

Clegg/Austin Marshall Clegg & Assoc., Inc.,
Austin, Texas

Commercial Carpets Consultants of Texas,
El Paso, Texas

E. G. Jenkins Co.,
Dallas, Texas

Base Proposal "H"

(Guest Chairs)

$10,917.50

$12,016.00

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Add Alternate ‘'H-1"
(Addit. Guest Chairs)

Bidders

Rockford Business Interiors,
Austin, Texas

Abel Contract Furniture &
Equipment Co., Inc.,
Austin, Texas

American Desk Mfg. Co.,
Temple, Texas

Business Products & Services, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

The Carpet Pile of Texas, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

The Carpet Shop,
El Paso, Texas

Carpet Services of San Antonio,
San Antonio, Texas

Central Distributing Co.,
San Antonio, Texas

Clegg/Austin Marshall Clegg & Assoc., Inc.,
Austin, Texas

Commercial Carpets Consultants of Texas,
El Paso, Texas

E. G. Jenkins Co.,
Dallas, Texas

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

$1,909.50

$2,095.40

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid
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Bidders
Highland Interiors Inc.,
Lubbock, Texas

House of Carpets Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

Regal Supply & Chemical,
El Paso, Texas

San Antonio Floor Finishers, Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

Sherrill Draperies, Inc.,
Irving, Texas

Stewart Office Supply Co.,
Dallas, Texas

Wittig's, Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

Base Proposal "H"
(Guest Chairs)

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bidders
Highland Interiors Inmc.,
Lubbock, Texas

House of Carpets Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

Regal Supply & Chemical,
El Paso, Texas

San Antonio Floor Finishers, Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

Sherrill Draperies, Inc.,
Irving, Texas

Stewart Office Supply Co.,
Dallas, Texas

Wittig's, Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

Add Alternate "H-1"
(Addit. Guest Chairs)

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid
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Bidders

Abel Contract Furniture &
Equipment Co., Inc.,
Austin, Texas

Rockford Business Interiors, Inc.,
Austin, Texas

American Desk Mfg. Co.,
Temple, Texas

Business Products & Services, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

The Carpet Pile of Texas, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

The Carpet Shop,
El Paso, Texas

Carpet Services of San Antonio,
San Antonio, Texas

Central Distributing Co.,
San Antonio, Texas

Clegg/Austin Marshall Clegg & Assoc., Inc.,

Austin, Texas

Commercial Carpets Consultants of Texas,
El Paso, Texas

E. G. Jenkins Co.,
Dallas, Texas

Alternate "H-2" to
Base "H" (In leiu
of Base "H')

$7,073.70

$10,046.80

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Alternate "H-3"
Alt. "H-2" (Alternate
Guest Chairs)

Bidders

Abel Contract Furniture &
Equipment Co., Inc.,
Austin, Texas

Rockford Business Interiors, Inc.,
Austin, Texas

American Desk Mfg. Co.,
Temple, Texas

Business Products & Services, Inc,,
El Paso, Texas

The Carpet Pile of Texas, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

The Carpet Shop,
El Paso, Texas

Carpet Services of San Antonio,
San Antonio, Texas

Central Distributing Co.,
San Antonio, Texas

Clegg/Austin Marshall Clegg & Assoc., Inc.

Austin, Texas

Commercial Carpets Consultants of Texas,
El Paso, Texas

E. G. Jenkins Co.,
Dallas, Texas

$1,276.78

$1,779.92

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

to
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Bidders
Highland Interiors Inc.,
Lubbock, Texas

House of Carpets, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

Regal Supply & Chemical,
El Paso, Texas

San Antonio Floor Finishers, Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

Sherrill Draperies, Inc.,
Irving, Texas

Stewart Office Supply,
Dallas, Texas

Wittig's, Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

Alternate "H-2" to
Base "H" (In lieu
of Base "H")

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Bidders
Highland Interiors Inc.,
Lubbock, Texas

House of Carpets, Inc.,
El Paso, Texas

Regal Supply & Chemical,
El Paso, Texas

San Antonio Floor Finishers, Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

Sherrill Draperies, Inc.,
Irving, Texas

Stewart Office Supply,
Dallas, Texas

Wittig's, Inc.,
San Antonio, Texas

Alternate "H-3" to
(Alternate

Alt. "B-2"

Guest Chairs)

No

No

No

No

No

No

No

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid




Base Proposal "I" Add Alternate "I-1"

Bidders (Window Blinds & Draperies) Bidders (Addit. Lined Drapery)
E. G. Jenkins Co., Inc., $7,396.09 E. G. Jenkins Co., Inc., $ 600.73
Dallas, Texas : Dallas, Texas
Sherrill Draperies,. Inc., $5,035.11 Sherrill Draperies, Inc., $3,946.39
Irving, Texas Irving, Texas
Highland Interiors, Inc., $13,146.67 ~ Highland Interiors, Inc., $5,714.00
v Lubbock, Texas Lubbeck, Texas
é Abel Contract Furniture & No Bid Abel Contract Furniture & No Bid
ﬁ Equipment Co., Inc., Equipment Co., Inc.,
Austin, Texas Austin, Texas
American Desk Mfg. Co., No Bid American Desk Mfg. Co., No Bid
g Temple, Texas Temple, Texas
al C
E) Business Products & Services, Inc., No Bid Business Products & Services, Inc., No Bid
) El Paso, Texas El Paso, Texas
X}
®©  The Carpet Pile of Texas, Inc., No Bid The Carpet Pile of Texas, Inc., No Bid
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